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NHTI’s dining program and a Registered
Dietitian will work with parents, school
nurses, teachers, and healthcare providers
to help manage students’ food allergies and
special diets by:

Working with physicians, dietitians, or
qualified nutrition specialists to manage
dietary substitutions. 

Knowing where emergency medications are
stored and knowing how they should be
administered.

Reviewing menus with parents or students
who have food allergies to determine if any
menu items need to be substituted.

Welcome to the dining program at NHTI! We
offer a program that meets the needs of
today’s college student. 

Each year, you will experience exciting
changes, fresh menus, and new
enhancements to your dining experience. 

The enhancements will be a result of the
feedback and input of students, faculty, and
staff on campus.

https://nhti.campus-dining.com/

BeWell is our wellness program to help you
have a more balanced dining experience!
Our BeWell wellness approach combines
the latest in food science and trendy
recipes to create crave-worthy menu
choices every day. We offer daily, weekly,
and monthly specials, free take-home
recipes, wellness promotions, and more!

Be sure to look for the BeWell blueberry
icon in the Dining Hall.
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